
MDiv Program Student Learning Outcome 2020 

Goal 1: Growth in self-awareness, personal spiritual vitality and maturity, character, interpersonal 
relationships, and ministerial gifts. 
 

 
 

 

1. Has developed spiritual
discipline such as daily

devotion time regularly (3-5
times a week)

2. Shows increased desire to
draw closer to God

3. Shows certain positive
behavior change

Exceed Expectation
Meet Expectation 3 3 3
Need Improvement
Unsatisfactory
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Spiritual Formation 
(student and spouse interview)

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation

Able to do in depth self-
reflection

Able to list or identify some
significant personal growth
during the program of study

Able to list or identify some
future growth goals

Exceed Expectation 4 4 3
Meet Expectation 5 6 5
Need Improvement 1 0 2
Unsatisfactory 0 0 0
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Capstone (Personal Reflection)

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation



 

 
 
 
 
Goal 2:  Competence in biblical knowledge, interpretation, and theological integration. 
 

 

(1) Shows maturity in
handling interpersonal

relationships

(2) Has adequate views of
self and others

(3) Shows vibrant team spirit
with the demonstration of

ministerial gifts
Exceed Expectation 1 2 1
Meet Expectation 6 4 5
Need Improvement 1 1
Unsatisfactory
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Small Group Mentor Evaluation

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation

1. Shows in depth
understand of biblical

passage

2. Has clear structure and
solid arguments

3. Provides adequeate
citations in the paper

Exceed Expectation 3 3 4
Meet Expectation 3 3 2
Need Improvement 1 1 1
Unsatisfactory 0 0 0
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Poetic Books and Wisdom Literature (term project/paper)

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation



 

 

 

 

a. To describe the
historical context of
the Pauline Epistles,
Hebrews, James, 1

and 2 Peter, the
Johannine Epistles,

Jude, and
Revelation.

b. Able to grasp the
contents, literary

features, and
theological message

of each book

c. Able to interpret
selected texts from

these books by using
critical method(s)

d. Able to integrate
and apply the

messages of these
books in ways that

foster Christian
practice

Exceed Expectation 2 1 3 2
Meet Expectation 2 2 1 2
Need Improvement 0 1 0 0
Unsatisfactory 0 0 0 0
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New Testament Survey II

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation

Able to express clearly his
or her theological stances.

Shows clear logics in the
description.

Provides adequate biblical
support.

Exceed Expectation 1 1 1
Meet Expectation 7 6 6
Need Improvement 2 3 2
Unsatisfactory 1
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Capstone (6 theological issues project)

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation



Goal 3: Competence in essential ministerial and leadership skills. 
 

 
 

 

Relate spiritual
resources to incorporate

in counseling

Apply principles of
counseling theories to a

case

Role play and articulate
effective and ineffective
processes occurring in

counseling
Exceed Expectation 3 2 2
Meet Expectation 2 3 3
Need Improvement
Unsatisfactory
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Pastoral Counseling II (Role Play Presentation)

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation

Able to analyze a biblical
passage and create
sermon outline that

accurately reflects the
message of the text

Able to demonstrate the
grasp of the ingredients

of a good expository
sermon by given

insightful critiques

Able to write and deliver
a sermon in an effective

manner

Exceed Expectation 3 2 1
Meet Expectation 2 3 4
Need Improvement 1 1 1
Unsatisfactory 0 0 0
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Preaching Methods II 
(Scripture Analyses, Outlines, and Sermons)

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation



 

 

Goal 4:  Passion for global evangelism and Cultural sensitivity in ministry settings 

 

Provides adequate
analysis of the context

Able to apply biblical or
theological principles in

the case study

Shows skills of theological
thinking

Exceed Expectation 3 2 1
Meet Expectation 2 3 4
Need Improvement 1 1 1
Unsatisfactory 0 0 0
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Capstone (exam)

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation

1. Provides adequate
analysis of the context

2. Shows understanding of
ministry challenges

3. Able to integrate class
materials in the solutions

he or she offers
Exceed Expectation 2 2 2
Meet Expectation 4 4 4
Need Improvement
Unsatisfactory
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Asian American Ministry I

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation



 

Willing to adapt to the
cross-cultural setting

Takes initiatives to break
cultural barriers

Able to serve in a
contextualized setting

Exceed Expectation 1 0 0
Meet Expectation 8 9 9
Need Improvement 0 0 0
Unsatisfactory 0 0 0
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Summer Mission Internship 
(in cross-cultural setting)

Unsatisfactory Need Improvement Meet Expectation Exceed Expectation


